
2026

BID RESULTS
02/12/2026

Bids Extended for 2026

Overband Crackseal-Fahrner

1/15/26 Cold Patch Bidder Material

Unique Paving Materials UPM Cold Mix

Ajax Materials Corp UPM 

Awarded to Ace Saginaw Paving Co QPR

1/15/26 Concrete/Cement Awarded to SRM Concrete

Bidder Concrete 3500 Concrete 4500 Cement/Bag Flowable Fill

SRM Concrete $156.00/cyd $162.00/cyd N/A by pound & Bag $145.00/cyd

1/15/26 Liquid Calcium Chloride Bidder Continuous Intermittent Road Commission Pickup Max Time Span Source of Material Described Dist Veh

Wilkinson Solutions $.21 p/gal $.25 p/gal $.12 p/gal 24-48 hrs Wilkinson #3 Brine Well Semi Truck-Trailer

Awarded to Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales $.712 p/gal $.722 p/gal $.612 p/gal 1-2 Days Oxy Chem Co

Pressure 

Applied, Pos 

Displacement

1/15/26 Professional Eng Serv Feasibility Study for Drainage-Phelps Lake & Schott

Consultant Lump Sum Cost

Surveying Solutions $23,760.00

Fleis & VandenBrink $26,400.00

Fenton Land Surveying $63,200.00

Rowe Prof Serv Co $43,200.00

Spicer Group $8,800.00

1/15/26 Professional Eng Serv Drinange Design-Remington Rd/M-81 N .27 Miles

Consultant Lump Sum Cost

Spicer Group $20,300.00

Gourdie Fraser $28,300.00

Rowe Prof Serv Co $58,980.00

Fenton Land Surveying $58,000.00

Fleis & VandenBrink $37,900.00

Surveying Solutions $17,140.00

1/15/26 Professional Eng Serv Drainage Design-Gunnell Rd, Belsay E .26 miles

Consultant Lump Sum Cost

Spicer Group $14,500.00

Gourdie Fraser $33,800.00

Rowe Prof Serv Co $59,280.00

Fenton Land Surveying $51,650.00

Fleis & VandenBrink $33,300.00

Surveying Solutions $17,600.00

1/29/26 Hired Equipment Various equip/bidders Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC as Needed

1/29/26 Cr. Gravel Price Proposal See Attached

Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC

$135.75

$130.58

Price Per Ton

$135.40
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2/12/26 HMA Machine Patches

Local Road Price Per Ton 10<HMA<50       25<HMA<50 50<HMA Skip Patching > 50 Skip Patching HMA<50 Butt Joint      HMA Surf Rmvl Cold Milling 1/2 day Cold Milling Whole Day

Contractor  0<HMA<5       5<HMA<10

Pavement Rec No Bid    No Bid No Bid     No Bid No Bid No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $5,000.00

Astec Asphalt $690.00        $640.00 $460.00     $340.00 $285.00 $265.00 $320.00 $400.00   $60.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00

Asphalt Repair Inc $400.00   $385.00 $350.00   $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $500.00  No Bid $3,000.00 $5,500.00

Ace Saginaw No Bid    No Bid $800.00   $275.00 $250.00 $250.00 $220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Primary Road Price Per Ton 10<HMA<50       25<HMA<50 50<HMA Skip Patching > 50 Skip Patching HMA<50

Contractor  0<HMA<5       5<HMA<10

Pavement Rec No Bid     No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid

Astec Asphalt $820.00    $740.00 $490.00    $380.00 $295.00 $290.00 $350.00

Asphalt Repair Inc $400.00  $385.00 $350.00  $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00

Ace Saginaw No Bid     No Bid $800.00  $275.00 $250.00 $250.00 $220.00

2/12/26 Chip Seal Awarded to Fahrner

Contractor Contract Item Pay Unit Unit Price

Fahrner Chip Seal, Single Syd $2.28

Chip Seal, Double Syd $4.35

Chip Seal, Prime and Double Syd $5.35

Seal, Polymer Scrub (PASS) Syd $3.05 *MDOT

Raised Pavement Markers Each $2.00

Seal, Fog Syd $0.43

Seal, Bar 12'-3' Syd $2.73

2/12/26 Crush, Shape, Stabilize Awarded to PRI

Contractor
HMA Base Crushing and 

shaping and compaction, 

4 inch (Local Road)

HMA Base Crushing shaping 

and Compaction, 8 inch 

(Primary Road) Water     

1" Additional Crushing 

and Shaping

Asphalt Cement 

Stabilized Base 

Course, 4" Asphalt Cement Binder

PRI $1.39 SYD $1.39 SYD $25.00 Unit $.15 SYD $1.59 SYD $4.15 Gal

2/12/26 O'Brien from Leix to Chambers, G,B, & D Design

Consultant Cost for Design Pkg (no safety grant) Cost Saving (LIDAR/Sheets Provided)

Gourdie-Fraser Inc $56,000 Deduct $7,000 from Design Pkg

Rowe Prof Serv Co $52,495 $37,349.00

Surveying Solutions $56,555 $4,000 Savings

Spicer Group $82,200 $63,000.00

2/12/26 Locust St:  Saginaw St to Dead End G,B,D Design

Consultant Cost for Design Pkg

Surveying Solutions $19,860

Spicer Group $56,500

Rowe Prof Serv Co $32,335

Gourdie-Fraser Inc $38,500

2/12/26 Fenner Rd: Van Geisen to Gilford Rd G,B,D Design

Consultant Cost for Design Pkg

Surveying Solutions $49,320

Spicer Group, Inc $83,700

Rowe Prof Services Co $51,935

Gourdie-Fraser Inc $61,000
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2/12/26 Chambers Rd Fed Aid HMA Overlay Design M46-Washburn

Consultant Cost for Design Pkg

Surveying Solutions $17,150

Spicer Group Inc $24,600

Rowe Prof Serv Co $29,090

Gourdie-Fraser Inc $15,540


